—————
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APPENDIX -Xl|
FIRE SAFETY CERTIFICATE

No. /A D EKL//\’UVA' moneL RESIDENTIALDated: 2_6/05720%"
Certified that the ....~SC.700L... A HORING (name of the building or

premises) at .... AHORINA. ... N AHASADOND. (HAATTILS. 5. AR (address)

comprised Of ... e basement(s) @nd ........coiiii

(upper floors) owned/ occupied by EXLAVYA.. MO DELRESINENTIAL . SEHoD L. (name of
the institution) have complied with the fire prevention and fire safety requirements in accordance with
rule of State/ UT Fire Service Rules, and verified by the officers concerned of Fire Service

o] o H (date of inspection) in the presence OF oot ittt eaie s i e mne s bn b ae (name and
addresses of the Manager/ Secretary or his representative) and that the building/ premises is fit for
occupancy upto classes ....... _Z]I ................ ( X/ XIl) With effect from 2. £/ .D_ST/ZQ.M.’.._for a
period of ........... OL ... year in accordance with rule and subject to compliance of specific

conditions as appended:-

1.

2

3.

4

Issued on .24/ 0.5 |22 24 . (date of issue) at B -V ey A (place) by
*Strike out whichever is not applicable.

Signature with Seal: .............. {T{El’ﬂ iy s+ g g
Name !'IT‘"T ..........................

W3y aea<
Designation ':Scw‘g).qmzﬁ ...................

Name & Address of Department/ Office: ...............

To
R ot anu Al (-6
tmARS  Bhoavy 0)\e- — U9z N

(Name & Address of the Institution)

ENDORSEMENT

The No Objection Certificate issued by Fire Service stand cancelled an annulled due

(reasons to be recorded).
(Name and designation of the authorized signatory)

* The filled up certificate should be either in Hindi or English. If it is issued in vernacular language,
translated notarized version in English be uploaded along with the original vernacular certificate as a
single pdf.
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Undertaking by Principal of the School-OASIS Data Updation

I MARENDRA KUMAR, TANDﬁAfPrincipal Name) of school

El<inavya Mopel RESIDENTIA( gumool BHORING (School Name)

with Affiliation No. 22207277  hereby confirm that the entire OASIS data is

updated as on 2[/06/%’4&1'(@)-

%}/
rincipal

PRINCEIRAL
BLAVYA MODEL RESIDENTIAL SCRODL,
BHORIKG DIST. - BAHASARUND (C.G)
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Reportna. DL/PHED/M A= 17

Senders name & address-:

wrard
| vavera ameet smarliy Rgae L fecel -
i = s receipt no. 17 DL Recelpt date 22/04728
Date of nnnlysis started 22/0425 Date of wnalysis completed 22/04128

Format No. DL/PHED/MANU/E/O1

District Water Testing Laboratory

Public Health Enginecring Department, Div. Mahasamund
Near collector office, Behind RTO offlce, BTI road, Mahasamund (C.G.) Pin Codo- 493445

Phone - 07723-299140

EmailiD - eemah-phe-cy @gov .in

Iso /IECAI:I_QZZS(-}‘(EZ‘(\NABL Accredited Laboratory)

Discipline-: Chemicnl
lesting

Vest Report (Delnklng Wadter)

Group=1Dreinking water | ULR No ;-

Senders letter no/Date

TC127080000000017)

Sampled by

Customer

0772104728

Sampling Plan & procedure

Sampling nat done by Lab stafr

Sample Details

Sample 1D

Block City / Village

Linbitation/Locntion/Source

17/04/25/216

Mahasamund

TEoeg ey ararfe g MRT — AR

Details of parameters their test method units and specification as per IS/APHA

S.N Parameters Test method 1S:3025/APHA 24th As per 1S-10500-2012 :
ed. (Second Revision) Result of S.No
Drinking water
Unit
Method Part no. Acceptable | Permissible

limit limit 1 2 3 4 5 6

1 2 3 4 s 6 7
1 Chloride as CI' APHA :2024 4500-CI-B mg/l 250 1000 25.58 - - - - -
: Total Dissolved solids APHA : 2024 2540-C mg/l. 500 2000 250 - - - - -
3 Alkalinity as CaCO3 APHA : 2024 2320-B mg/l. 200 600 162.36 - - - - -
4 | Calcium as Ca® APHA : 2024 3500-Ca-B mg. 75 200 60.5 ; 2 - i i
g Magnesium as Mg? APHA :2024 3500 Ng-B mg/l. 30 100 17.35 - - - - -

6 < No
pH 1S:3025 :2022 Part-11 pH scale 6.5-8.5 celaxation 7.11 - - - - -
Z Turbidity 1S:3025 : 2023 Part-10 NTU 1 5 2.6 - . - L -
8 Total Hardness as CaCO3 APHA : 2024 2340-C mg/l. 200 600 222.36 - - - X o
9 Taste 1S:3025 : 2023 Part-8 - Agreeable Agreenble - - - - - -

10 _

Odour 1S:3025 :2018 Part-3 B Agreeable Agreeable Agr. - - - - =
FI Color APHA :2024 2120-B Hazen 5 15 6 - - - - -

. The results refer only to tested

?UN»—

This Lab does not hold any res
5.Agrecable is denoted by Agr.
Note - 1. Results apply to the sa

. Samples will be stored for a period of 10 day

samples and parameters
ponsibility for v

mple as received.

The report should not be produced partly or full without approval signatory authority of legal purpose. .

s from date of issue of report.
ariation in results for samples kept on hold for wants of clarification.

2.The Laboratory does not give interpretation on Test result Passed/ Failed.

Lab.Issue no...17......Issue Date......25/04/2025...... Page no...1...... of... 200

Report Reviewed & approved by

Authorired Signatory




- Formiat No. DL/PHED/NMAL/1Y/ |
District Water Testing Laboratory ‘
Public Health Engineering Department,Div. Mahasamund

Near collector office, Behind RTO office, BT road, Mahasamund (C.G.) Pin Codo-493445

{i‘ | Phone —07723-299140 Emall ID -eemah-phe-cg @gov .in e o
' Test Report (Drinking Water)

Reportno. DL/APHED/MAH ~ 17 Group-: | Drinking water

Senders name & address-:

ﬂﬁﬂ"’j Senders letter no./Date 07210425 Sacapled by Customer

e e o Sampling Plan & procedure Sampling not done by Lab stalf

T I FEEg= DL receipt no. 17 DL Receipt date 22/04725
Date of analysis started 22/04125 Date of analysis completed 23/04125

S.N Sample ID Block City / Village Sample Detaik Habitation/Location/Source

V1 170425216 Mahasamund oA oY AR fggem AT - aR

Details of parameters their test method units and specification as per IS/APIA

S.
N Test method 1S:3025/APHA 24th As per 1-10500-2012 —
ed. (Second Revision) esult of S.No
Parameters Drinking water
Unit
Method Part no. Acceptable Permissible
limit limit 1 2 3 4 5 6
1 2 3 <4 5 6 7
12 Fluoride as F~ APHA :2024 4500-F-C mg/l. 1 1.5 < - - - - -
Residual . ofl 0.2 1 0.0 - - - - -
13 | chiorine mg/t.
14 | Sulphate as 15:3025 Part-24 mgh. 200 400 158 g . - . .
SO,
15 Nitrate as NO; APHA :2024 4500-NO;-B mg/l. 45 45 9.24 - - - = -
18 Iron as Fe APHA :2024 3500-Fe-B mg/l. 1.0 1.0 0.281 - - - - -
CFU/100 i - = _ : R } }
i E.coli APHA :2024 9222-J ml Nil Nil Nil

1. The report should not be produced partly or full without approval signatory authority of legal purpose.

2. The results refer only to tested samples and paramelzrs. f‘ ; ;
3. Samples will be stored for a period of 10 days from date of issuc ol report. ) C. .
j ThispLab does not hold any responsibility for variation in results for samples kept on hold for wants of clarification.

Note- 1. Results apply to the sample as received.

W,
P.1L.E Sub Div. Mahasamund (C.G)

Lab.Issue no...17...... Issue Date...25/04/2025...... Page no...l...... of...2......

|
§

bt



APPENDIX -XIll

PROFORMA FOR SAFE DRINKING WATER AND SANITARY CONDITION CERTIFICATE

No. |65~ Dated: ,25"/54/ 2025

(Name of Officers with designation) from ...

(Name of Department/ Office) inspected the L&V

(Name & Address of the school) on €559«

the s FN RS RORING ( Name of school) has safe drinking water facilities

for the students and members of staff of the institution and is maintaining the hygienic sanitation

condition in the school building & the campus as per norms prescribed by the Central/ State/ U.T. Govt.

The above is valid for a period of ‘2,@25“——26
;9?}_:':5_—.
Signature with Seal: . ...
W= sRrday
Name : mwﬂrﬁ‘ﬁﬁv ..............
ST-WI Aag (B.7.)
Designation T e e e e e e e e s i nruin o 6y o

Name & Address of the Office / Department : ........
PeHe & Sub DV . Mohat anund (cer

<K Lavyd Mo Jd ReS/.
......... gkm@,@ij}_ﬁ{awlw(

(Name & Address of the Institution)

* The filled up certificate should be either in Hindi or English. If it is issued in vernacular language,

translated notarized version in English be uploaded along with the original vernacular certificate as a

single pdf.
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Annexure D

BUILDING SAFETY CERTIFICATE

No. L5

It is certified that the existing building LL.KLQ Mods QHI'.QQ.I\.JH'EL.’..&«.IA.%J.(name of the

building or premises) at ....... Bhor .)f@....ﬂ.q.h.a_é.q PN

oovenn... (address) is having block(s)/Floor(s) as per details below:

Detail of Block(s) in Block Block Block Block Block

school (1) (2) (3) (4) (5)

No. of Floor(s) in the
e | geeh | Geel | Gud | oA G

Block

P.'}.‘.‘ .......................................... (name

The building is owned/occupied by
accordance with National

of the Institution) have complied with the Building safety requirements in
Building code Rules, and verified by the officers concerned of ....... PWJ}H) ........... (Name’of

on.....2.0.5:R&......(date  of inspecticn) in  the presence of

Department/  Gowt.)
(name and addresses of the

r his representative) and that the building/premises is fit for occupancy for

Manager/Secretary o
for a period of ..... b= 1 N years in accordance

running school with effect from
with rule and subject to compliance of the specific conditions as appended.

4.

Issued on

« Strike out whichever is not applicable. In case of block is more than six use separate sheet for

Signature with Seal : \\'J—’/

Name : F@nsha ram S Aer

detail.

Designation: 5D -0 °
Name & Address of Department/ Office:

65|Page

e,
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'E ’DD/
APPENDIX -XIV

Office Memorandum No. 24/ 3 Lf' Date: ~ &/ DS// 20 Vot

...................
............................................

From To i
DE2 . EKLAYVYA. mepEl RESIDENTINL
Mabhasamand C-4. ClHaoL. BHDRiNg.  MARASAMUN
. CHRATT IS L K

(Name and Address of issuing department) (Name& Address of school)

Sir/Madam,
Sub: Issue of No Objection Certificate to=/"700 0 foieeeeeen T A v o
(Name & Address of school) for affiliation to the Central Board of Secondary

............................

Education—Regarding.

Ref:
mopet.. RERIRE AT R SO0 BHORING

(Name & Address of Trust/ Society / Company) (Registered
OFfiCE, wevverrreenrreeiinniinnaerneieas ) is accorded “Certificate of Recognition” from the

academic year .....ccevceeienns D ..« oo it v e for Classes | to VIII Standard under section

18 of Right of Children to Free and Compulsory Education Act- 2009 and Rule ...cocoovviininenns
(State Act/ Rules).

Details of School

1. Name: ERLAVYA MIDEL RESIDENTIAL scrool BHIRING
2. Survey No: &§74-4 | 5440 Sty SGEll 5 &5 7

3. Revenue Village / City: A~ 0p1n ¢

4. Taluk : MAHA eV UND

5. Total area of land: —~2 DO O T

6. Recognition Code: C & SE. AFFILYATLION © 2,72, 2.0 2715

The Department &s%wzfédua% SN~
. P M[Mﬂﬁfb&i—:?d P (Name & Address of State Education
epartment) has No Objection for the Correspondent of
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APPENDIX -X1V

thew Eklay, J’\7"4“«'Q"'“MJOT\HQL‘&MJ;RL\W} (Name & Address of

school) for applying for affiliation to Central Board of Secondary Education, subject to the

conditions laid down in the Certificate of Recognition.

The School Management Shall be having full responsibility if any .court case arise in this
regard. The details furnished if any by the management is found to be false or incorrect at any
stage, this No Objection Certificate is liable to be cancelled
’21”8” 26/0)’/2025' !L_D/fgg/g
Signature with Seal: ...... iﬂ'f R 3Rrpre}
HERTE | (5.7, )

Name of issuing authority: ..7...= 27

Designation: ......ooeeevveerenienen i

Copy To:

1. The Correspondent. E/V)K§£ }’)@/’/‘VZV ............ (Name & Address of school).

2. The Secretary, Central Board of Secondary Education, 2 Community Centre, Preet

Vihar, Delhi 110092

* The filled up certificate should be either in Hindi or English. If it is is
d along with the original vernacular certificate as a

sued in vernacular language,

translated notarized version in English be uploade

single pdf.
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NO : CBSE/3320277/EX-03214-2223/2022-23/ Dated: 06/08/2021

The Principal,
EKLAVYA MODEL RESIDNTL SCH BHORING MAHASAMUND CG
EKLAVYA MODEL RESIDENTIAL SCHOOL,BHORING,THANA- MATIASAMUND

CHHATISGARH,MAHASAMUND, 493445

(M: 0-0)

SUBJECT: -Extension of Regular Affiliation up to Secondary/Senlor Secongdary Leyel.

This is with reference to school application on the subject cited above. In this connection, it is to

intimate that in view of current COVID-19 pandemic which has severely affected the normal functioning of
schools in the country, however, the school is pursuing to provide extension of affiliation so as to avoid any
difficulty for the purpose of admission/ registration/ obtaining loan/ renewal of various safety certificates
from appropriate state authorities.

Therefore, the Board after due consideration has accorded one time relaxation for extension of alfiliation
based on details/ data submitted by school in online application for further period of 05 ycars as per details

given below:-
Affiliation No used as User ID for
both OASIS and 3320277
LOC/Registration System
l School No [ 17306 }
r Affiliated for ﬁixtension of Regular Affiliation |
Category i Extension of Affiliation ]

Period of affiliation ]| 01.04.2021 t031.03.2026 |

The above sanction is subject to fulfillment of following conditions:-

1.

The approval is based upon the documents /data/information uploaded by the school online. The
school will be responsible for its genuineness. In case of any discrepancies, necessary action will be
initiated against the school as per Affiliation Bye -Laws-2018.

The school will follow the RTE Act, 2009 and instructions issued thereon by the CBSE/Respective
State /UT Govt. from time to time. The school will also abide by the conditions prescribed, if any, by
the State Government concerned.

The School is required to apply on online for extension of affiliation along with the requisite fec and
other documents as per Rule 10.3 of Affiliation Bye Laws.

The school should go through the provision of Affiliation and Examination Bye Laws and subscquent
amendment therein as well as circulars and guidelines /instructions issued by the Board time to time
and keep a copy there of for reference purpose and is also advised to regularly visit CBSE websites
i.¢., http://cbseacademic.nic.in/ & http://cbse.nic.in/ for updates.

The school to renew mandatory certificates from time to time.

The school shall be solely responsible for any legal consequences arising out of the use of school
name/logo/society/trust or any other identity /activity related to running of school affiliated to CBSE.
All legal expenses incurred by the Board, if any, arising out of these circumstances, shall be borne by

the school.
The school should go through the Circular No. 13/2021 dated 27.07.2021 for strict compliance.

"The school shall possess valid fire safety certificate and Building safety certificate during
functioning of the school which shall be renewed from time to time as per norms".

DEPUTY SECRETARY/JOINT SECRETARY (AFF.)
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»
[ o

| B AFFIDAVIT .
CW’!@WWM

T

i g
, % I/We @Jaﬁ/l‘\ )’ch S:J\ ’/I’\‘L' L_C/p son of / Daughter of />
Wife of, age __ £} (years), President of Secre ary of the D16+ D ) ejal/ )

i o = ) 2. < MQL’L\A\_QO\‘YY» (Name of the society/
Truse/Company under section 8) running the

EA T (Name of the School) do hereby

g solemnly affirm and sincerely state as follows :-

g 1. That Drg'_g_’-’ C)e;ta/L me—> M U\LQSC (Name of the
society/ Truse/Company under section 8) is a registered Society / Truse under
the ' ( Name of

#  the Act. under which society/trust is registered/Section). g

i ! R IB {Y)a/i\g_ém/%«/{mame of

; 2. That the -

the society/ Truse/Company under s
g 3. That the School is being run as a c
mmercialization does not take place in th

tion 8) is of Non-Proprietary Character.
ommunity service and not as a
e School in any

e

husiness and that co

That no part of income from the Institution is being and will be

1 in the Trust/Soc1ety/Company/School Management
ty. The savmg[ if any, after meeting the

PTO

d o any individua
be or to any other person/enti




R T

2
diture and contributions to developmental,

and non recurting expen
i1 be further utilized for promoting the

" pecurting
ation and contingency funds, W
ducation in the same sehool only .

pes towards using name, motto,

Depreci
school and extending the cause of'e
That school is not paying any cht

5.
mic activities to any other

logo or any other non-acnde institution, organization or

body.
/ 0. That the school will notopen classes under CBSE pattern particularly
ithout obtaining

) olass IN/N/XI/XIT and will not use CBSE name in any manner wi

affiliation,
7. That the Principal
ne through the provisions contained in the

and Correspondent/Manager of the school have
affiliation & examination

ime to time. The school
ffiliation & examination

individually go
byvelaws and the circulars issued by the Board from t

2, undertakes to abide by the provisions contained in the a

\\ byelaws, directions issued from time to time and the law of the land.
) 8. That the school will ensurs compliance of all statutory requirements

like EPF, ESI and Labour Laws etc. with respect to the school and staff of the

school .
21 '/ 4 - 9
> < %CQ‘?/ Water Safety,

concerned municipal or state authorities from time to time as

That the school will ensure that the Building Saftey, Fire Safety,

Health and Sygiene certificates are being issued or renewed by the
per the prescribed

term.

10 That the school will ensure that all required infrastructure is available

with the school before starting classes.
That the school will ensure that sufficient number of qualified teachers

g 11

€1 . v ' . g

7 as per the provisions contained in affiliation bye-laws are available with the school

& before starting classes.

: ,,‘;; 12 That the school will follow the provisions related to fee contained in
f affiliation bye laws and will disclose the details of the fee to the students/parents

every year before start of session with out resorting to any hidden charges in the

heads of the fee.
13 That the school will not coerce any student/parent to buy books/

stationary/uniform from any particular shop.
14 That the school shall strive to make efforts for conservation of

environment.

PTO




-3

15 That the school will ensure that the school fulfills all essential

requirement before applying for affiliation and will fulfill all other conditions post

atfiliation and comply with all the general rules as given in the affiliation byelaws
or notified from time to time .

16.  That in case affiliation has been with certain conditions, the school

will not start CBSE pattern classes with out submitting certificate/affidavit to the
effect that the school has complied with all the conditions imposed by CBSE

and the post affiliation conditions contained in affiliation byelaws along with
general rules.

(In_case of school's application is under switch over category please include
the following clause in the affidavit ).

17 That State pattern classes IX to XII running prior to the affiliation to

CBSE would be sponsored for the State Board Examination. State Pattern classes

/ IX 10 XII will be closed in a phased manner. No admission will be taken in the

State Board Pattern Class IX to XII after getting affiliation from CBSE. The
State Board School will be discontinues after switchover to CBSE.
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